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reporter, Mr. Datwyler called/emailed the individual representing Renegade Public Affairs, 
an individual by the name of Carlos Sierra, to ask why Mr. Datwyler is listed as Treasurer of 
“Turn AZ Blue PAC”.7 To date, Mr. Datwyler has not heard back from Carlos Sierra.8 

There is no information available to suggest Mr. Datwyler was in any way involved 
with or aware of any of the issues giving rise to this matter. That is because Mr. Datwyler is
not, nor has he ever been, the treasurer of an entity named “Turn AZ Blue PAC”. Accordingly,
Mr. Datwyler respectfully requests that the Commission remove him from MUR 8253 and 
dismiss him from the matter entirely. Alternatively, the Commission should find no reason
to believe that Mr. Datwyler violated the Act because Mr. Datwyler is not, nor has he ever,
been the treasurer of an entity named “Turn AZ Blue PAC”. 

Respectfully, 

Frank M. Strigari 

Counsel to Thomas Datwyler 

7 Aff. ¶ 13. 
8 Id. ¶ 14. 
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---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: Thomas Datwyler 
Date: Fri, May 3, 2024 at 4:41 PM 
Subject: Re: MUR 8253 Notification Letter (Turn AZ Blue PAC) 
To: Christal Dennis <CDennis@fec.gov> 

Thank you for the clarification. Very strange. 

Thank you. 

On Fri, May 3, 2024 at 4:40 PM Christal Dennis <CDennis@fec.gov> wrote: 

Hi Tom,

 The PAC itself is not registered but they have you named as the treasurer in the complaint 
so if there is an error or you are not affiliated with this PAC you can respond that way but I 
did not send it in error. Once you read through the complaint you will be able to address it 
and again if you have no affiliation you can state that in your response.

 I hope this helps.

 Thanks, 

Christal  

 From: Thomas Datwyler 
Sent: Friday, May 3, 2024 5:21 PM 
To: Christal Dennis <CDennis@fec.gov> 
Subject: Re: MUR 8253 Notification Letter (Turn AZ Blue PAC) 

Hi Christal,

 I think this was mistakenly sent to me. I don't have any involvement with this PAC and 
see nothing registered with this name?

 Tom 
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---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: Gersony, Laura <Laura.Gersony@gannett.com> 
Date: Wed, May 8, 2024 at 5:03 PM 

To: Thomas Datwyler 
Subject: RE: AZ Republic question on Turn AZ Blue PAC 

Oh yeah, sorry about that – here’s the one listing you as the treasurer. 

 From: Thomas Datwyler > 
Sent: Wednesday, May 8, 2024 3:01 PM 
To: Gersony, Laura <Laura.Gersony@gannett.com> 
Subject: Re: AZ Republic question on Turn AZ Blue PAC 

Thanks, I might be crazy, but I don't see my name on any of these PDF's?

 On Wed, May 8, 2024 at 4:57 PM Gersony, Laura <Laura.Gersony@gannett.com> wrote: 

Sure thing. Attaching the invoices I’m looking at. Accessed via the FCC’s portal. Looks like 
they’re three different orders, of a couple hundred bucks each. 

 Crunching the numbers I’m seeing a total of $605 for these TV ad buys. But seems like 
there has been some other spending too, on texts and I believe a billboard. 

 So I’m hoping you can confirm the total amount Turn AZ Blue PAC has spent in this race so 
far in 2024. 

 Feel free to reach me: 

 From: Thomas Datwyler < 
Sent: Wednesday, May 8, 2024 2:49 PM 
To: Gersony, Laura <Laura.Gersony@gannett.com> 
Subject: Re: AZ Republic question on Turn AZ Blue PAC 

Interesting, could you please send this to me? I don't have any knowledge of it. 

On Wed, May 8, 2024 at 4:48 PM Gersony, Laura <Laura.Gersony@gannett.com> wrote: 

Hi Tom. I saw it in the FCC’s political programming disclosures. Back-of-the-envelope it 
seems like the sum is upwards of $800, can you provide an exact figure? 
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