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December 30, 2021

CELA@FEC.GOV

Federal Election Commission

Office of Complaints Examination & Legal Administration
Attn: Trace Keeys, Paralegal

1050 First Street, N.E.

Washington, DC 20463

Dear Trace Keeys:

I write in response to the complaint in MUR 7950 on behalf of Friends of Jessica Mason, in my
official capacity as Treasurer of Friends of Jessica Mason. The complaint alleges that a debt was not
settled between Friends of Jessica Mason and the complainant, Robyn Cain the co-founder of C2G
Strategies LLC.

The final communication sent by the complainant was received on December 20, 2021. I responded
to this communication on December 28, 2021 stating that despite believing the alleged debt to be in
question, the Friends of Jessica Mason committee would be paying the outstanding invoice in full.
Payment is to be received by the complainant on January 4, 2022. Copies of these communications
and proof of payment are attached to this response.

I hope that this resolves your questions.
Sincerely,

Kavin Jagnarain

On Thu, Dec 30, 2021 at 1:42 PM CELA <CELA @fec.gov> wrote:
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M Gma i | Elise Vess <elise@blueridgecampaigns.com>

Urgent delinquent invoice and next steps

robyn@c2gstrategies.com <robyn@c2gstrategies.com> Mon, Dec 20, 2021 at 4:45 PM
To: kavin jagnarain

Cc: Jessica Mason <jessica@jessicamasonforcongress.com>, Jessica Mason <masonforthepeople2022@gmail.com>, Billy
Cain <billy@c2gstrategies.com>, elise@blueridgecampaigns.com

Hello all,

C2G is making one final attempt to work professionally with the Jessica Mason for Congress campaign to settle its
outstanding debt of $665.

We have offered a compromise from the 1% daily late fee that was agreed upon in the contract signed and agreed by the
campaign effective January 1, 2021. We have done our best to settle this dissolution professionally and have been met
with refusal to adhere to the terms of the contract multiple times.

The following timeline records our repeated attempts to settle the account:

09/14/21 - Final invoice sent via email to campaign with no reply

10/04/21 — Second attempt to settle the final invoice via email with no reply

10/19/21 — Third attempt to settle final invoice via email with no reply

11/18/21 — Fourth attempt to settle final invoice via email and text to Kavin Jagnarain

11/18/21 — Kavin Jagnarain agreed to send the $665, acknowledging the validity of the debt owed to C2G, further stating
that a check for $665 would be mailed to C2G no later than November 30, 2021. He further stated that the campaign did
not accept the contracted late fees. As of today, the check has not been received by C2G.

11/19/21 — Robyn Cain made a final offer to the campaign to settle the balance for $665 via email.

11/19/21 — Kavin Jagnarain refused to settle the invoice, stating that he would be referring the matter to the campaign’s
attorney. This is the last contact we have had with the campaign.

While the campaign has noted a refusal to pay this valid debt, C2G is providing another opportunity to resolve this
between our two parties in the hope that resolution is possible and no further action or follow up will be needed.

Thank you and we look forward to a speedy resolution.

Regards,
Robyn and Billy Cain, C2G

Robyn Cain
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/2/?ik=14cf58d835&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f%3A1719703128840576788&simpl=msg-f%3A17197031288... 1/2
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Co-Founder, Managing Partner

(she/her)

STRATEGIES

COMMUNITY ROOTS. GLOBAL IMPACT.

(c)

robyn@c2gstrategies.com

c2gstrategies.com

The content of this email is confidential and intended for the recipient specified in the message only. It is strictly
forbidden to share any part of this message with any third party, without a written consent of the sender. If you
received this message by mistake, please reply to this message and follow with its deletion, so that we can ensure
such a mistake does not occur in the future.

[Quoted text hidden]

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/2/?ik=14cf58d835&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f%3A1719703128840576788&simpl=msg-f%3A17197031288... 2/2
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Urgent delinquent invoice and next steps

Jessica Mason <masonforthepeople2022@gmail.com> Tue, Dec 28, 2021 at 5:33 PM
To: robyn@c2gstrategies.com
Cc: Billy Cain <billy@c2gstrategies.com>, elise@blueridgecampaigns.com, kavin jagnarain <

Hello Robyn and Billy,

As we've stated before we believe the debt is in dispute. However; to put an end to this discussion we have mailed you a
check in the amount of $665 it should arrive on or before 1/04/22. Cashing this check means we are putting an end to this

dispute.
Best,

Kavin
[Quoted text hidden]

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/2/?ik=14cf58d835&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f%3A1720430981065074025&simpl=msg-f%3A17204309810... 1/1





