The partial reimbursement was received on friday april 28, 2006 and deposited
cen the same day.
Sent via BlackBerry from Cingular Wirelesms

----- Original Message--—---

From: BDeutsch@fec.gov

Date: Tue, 2 May 2006 10:55:25
To:rcoates@rcoateslaw.com
Cc:jlevindéfec.gov, ESferra@fec.gov
Subject: Detert Advisory Opinion Reguest

Mr. Coatas,

Kindly confirm that Ms. Detert has received and accepted partial reimbursement
from Randy Maddox in the amount of $67,450. Please also provide the date that
the partial reimbursement took place. Thank you.

Brad Deutsch

Assistant General Counsel - Policy
Federal Election Commission
Office of General Counsel

999 E Street, NW

Washington, DC 20463

202/694-1650D
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