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The abov"desc..ribed material was remove4
1e ' purxsuant to .the followingq exepdm o pol
Freedom of Inforthation Act* 5 U. S.aC. S4t1 o

(1) Cla4ssi fled. tformation

____(Z)Imternal, trzles &44
practices

(3):Exempted by other
statute'

(4) Trade s60ocets and,
comrca~t or

f inanca al ineoziation

~ (5) ornaJ. Documen~ts

(6), Personal. privacy

(7) Xmvet4gatory
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(8) Sani~L,
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Theo aoveldescribed material was reiovd. from- this
file pursuait to the following exemption provided in the

Freedom of Information. Act- , U,S 4C, Section 552(b) .

(1) Classified Information;

(2) Internal rules and
practices

(3) Exempted by other
statute

- (4) Trade secrets, aod
conaerciaX or
fiizAnciai iniformation

__($') I Mn~al DOC' ~ts

(6) Personal privacy

SQ ()nvesti,0ato-ry

___~~ (i) 14
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FIRST GMERAL ,oNSZLIS M

DATS AND TXJ4 $'A 4XMTTM.

SOURCE: InenlyGenete f0 a

Conducted'in tbe Vfic.e of

E 'Friends of Rohlf1 Cout
Party of Hawaii

AWArTWM 2 U.S.C. S44a4) (2)M

MRAL W~cS.aD 972 through 1976 cnidat,
Republican -Party of RHavU

OERA AGW(~~# IECED: None

BACKGROUND

Puzri 1. .Istaf f of the Genrtzal Co un Sell$ O)ffice
0 ta of, all- 116 House and ;Senate,,candidates .and Co

ermine thxe: .44tuie an4 extent of .the reportiU4 of_ 1o*"
4odteraine tha additional :' e iulations And lertoir
necessary. ~~atan A)

Durin this review, it first appear4 that the, Prie:
CommtteeMO~ttee'inHawaii bazrwd $5Or'OOO fromt t~

Party of Hasw*,UJ (Party) with no loan date indicated. N
possible exZei-tiv contribution in, vtolation,0 of tje Act
OpOned to ftat1lUtte further exam±*oation,

c swittoe and



xtztwsaminaion~ of tho reot of the Commtt
that it 3AO4 j qa) the *otvy t16 the, Pr in June,,, 19t2.,
PArty report~ to Oak~ $50*,000 f tidebi5OooOO
c O~mtte 0 * 4is i to ' 8fteber 1O, 1911 *prt ,e it 2ua4ft

,p tM* 16*n,. to the 4te9 Thi sit t
140 1t. 94 76 ~,;a n i t8 t*e*iinat on opcozt indited',

had been forgivenj (SW Atts**aert.. ,)

The caddaes prLicipal q~pag ooittee for 19,
citiz 'a for kohif**g for Congross Oomodttee (Citi*en0)
made n~o mention of aiydebts owe& to it or by- it that
ekither the Republican P~arty of May41i otihe Fr~iends of
Committee

LE&Z ~#~YI

Pursuant to AO 1975-05, 197506.. and particulailyf 1
the ConniSssion ruled that 'election#' as used in-38

,ans,any election occrriz1q after Januaky lr,, 197S.' Thu
*1atn an4 its sccessor, 2 E 0 'C S441a(a) (2), viould not
oan made in, 972~ There in, therefore, no6 4tolAtion of
,thig, the Coatnissionk.' urisdioation in this matter.

Flid
ie the

no reason to, bll1eve @1iy7vlolation Of the Act
file.

4,

3..



FEDERAL ELECTION COMMSSION
1125 K SI REU N.W.:
WA9"HINN0-C. 20463

wNoveibe.U. 1977

WHOODWTO: The COMMLSOU

William c, o3Aaker*
:Lester scall

William Yowlel

837-77 : A7nalysis of 1976 COMlS5i-fta l
Loan kctivity and i omdatiO

th" " en, ral Counsells staff has completed
** the, loan activity of al Ibs and $enate 04

!4ttee for the 1976 *lction to ft i

0 J)M 'with the loan poisions of te -t

ft,6Ai9, and recanenatiof, for furthe act i
io*ftin, are as follows:

Poo the rses of this study# w have.
It- violators a to tw e ro s e M i s

-o approiatey 275 reoptfs w r
3M zess" a ~.O n h'hv eitt*
~~ ti of thUolIn tm rhve r0p

I/ Due to the, large nu b er of reports with 10
Troor-: 75 0 in the House and Senate), the candid
tha~t have very small loans (generally less the

*bse reports have few errors and omissions:W
)avngapproximately 275 reports.



a. Interest rates of loans

g. Indication ,of loan repa
rates and no report of

The maJority of reports fall within this go i
approximately 150 reports that, donot include'
of -the above items; and the loans involved J#kt~S 4MO'nt to approximately 4000000

per port. For each of these- candidat**
p d spread sheets t t include all .

tLls of the loans.

Zn thersecond group we have placed candi44t,#
Littes who have reported loans of more than *$,

apparent surface reporting violations as well,
*~$h*certain questionable patterns and rlat
41i4 *.. and institutions,#_ r4cept. Of
*Al*# thZ Unmits wvhere fll details' of t*t
fbt livea andthose in which the follovin# #c

a. Loans not carried asebts

b. Loans quaranteed by individuals
excess of the Act's limitatiOin.,.
lations.

c. Excessive loans (generally greal
$2500) made by individuals

d. Report does not adequately. show
and basis on which Xparn wae fol~

e. Report intemingles candidate s
contributions.

2

c. Terms of security, guarantee, an4
endorsemeot.

d. Loans or coutributiOU4 On candi4t,
reports.

e. Carrying forward debts and loans
continuing QbiigationS.,

f. Reporting of previously undisclsi
loans receipts,

,1



.9'

'We idej
this,, Sroup.*
Is, approxim
per report.
candidates, j
information

II:.

Assigi:fteat, the i

Division.

Because of
DiselOsure Shootheae 150 z ohave iSprepa .

A decision
accompanied by.
would be fbimi
action' is vakra
should be sent.

coamittees

basis whtjirafoiuaioi
letter) w]
or whether

j/Because

committees
individuals

i i ' """"ONOi!



To assist in the
reports, the list of,
amount, House and Sa*i
All reports contaiug
the conidate/comti4
and we would. stt "ii
largest, loans, basical
(List A),* Those, repo
identified with loan i
category. list, (? Jwill be: Aesiqne to Ut
BlUR.)

second,

of

IV.

AlthoUgh it apprs as( thogh it will be.be selective in 4dediigwhAt cases to pursue,,the attached list gives Soidea of the uetentproblem and potntial for abuse. RVen if'the Coconcludes":that .no acti -on, is- warrinted in somne CAbelieve that ca b ase ree f 1976 actvitbe valuable iniasstriqg that this important sourCampai9n financing receives close Sour~tiny

A

C

1,o



C'Th IRY It Listing of - HOw

Cadiidate/Committee Loan

A. Greater than $1,

,o11vi 4ltstan4lSenate Candidal

Car idat*/CWitt.. Type of

The

State
'4===========



w
* I. ~k

'~

Type of Activity

4P

same as'above

:Large, loanfo b* P,4
uartated b~y -ca#4%t ~

vfi no terms *tcK

Candidate contritted
$100,000 and loaned
$100,000 to comp ttee,
no terms, etc.

• -. : ::.

V

* ~*

Loan from candidate
and Bank of . .
None of the loan was . ,

carried as a debt.
$50,145 repaid banka
nothing to candidate <

$16,378.03 uniteoized
loan. $112,37S.03 loans
and $12,500 in 'dbts to
individuals,

Large loans and nodtalls ... 00..

same as above, %R#4 00,

Large -loan from cundl4to *4~Z
and small one ,,fr= W.
Both need m o e a %-&,.

Large loan and no details $112,900,00



the rest "f "*cfUs~e

Stot £41,"ddt/Committee

4id-,

44444

S~f as "&,,

Candi~ I Iu

IaVVfter' ftl

$Q424.OO

t74

4444

Loans nt: p*ISy reported

I ,adftb

*1~

~44

o. ,. .



Contribution
candidate no
on candidate
No details 4
bavak loan I
f4 ) m a

t shea
s erts.

y R9" mad

M E4~8~ i'~'

2W

9f$~ Oft wv offldil

Sm as ae
Sme as 86,0ws xcpt
loan tmlvwi tred

cettteo% wfttb details*

Large loan *d -
details.

Quetions of A-MR~

no- ir 1

of other 1om.

Large loe and #A detai ls.

Large contribtan

S"6 ~

-Urv lo ad wdetis.

Sam as bmoe

9

4

I.

U

casdt4totcimi tt" r, .4f ,,AC

1L- 0

- a.

He ' s $ ,'L 
*



twmltte

-~

Sute

Need additionl
p!tion on low ..

01

531.000 loam fp'g-

and $50,000 ao,

wi th no detaf 1 1

Only $4s,o of $wo
l oan from
?FwJ carried a
Candidate also Costrtbjet"
$31,60 in

Large con t.RAWt*
frm candidat -
t details of $swc
of fvnds.

Large loan no " fls,
one repayment of $9,o3.

Loan not carried As, debt

Type of Activityy

Treasurer wrlt tqjb,
edment OfIQ 40

letterhead.

Loans to mtth w .....bee used foir 'an t.i-e"" Nxps$"



tidate/Com ttee Type of Activity

Loaned from candidate and
indivdual no details. $42,500.00

No details Of t
comitte kvy COewtat

-, - 4

LUrge I oul Aa

ft dtaiIs of left"

L

Excessive T~ oot
indfvidUal't it. nt
of S49,~ 9 N 00 1d o

LOAMs from "Wfte A
bank guaratmg L In--dividuals wiia * .. vialatift

Termlnattogl I
C ndi t cm m &s-Rl. il

etsJU 1I "Pal

were4

Treasurer wvtd at bonk
where loan w$ btsimd.

Loan by can4t ot o com.mltt"ie rpoiri -p

on ta 'oi

No fvrther dtfls

s*w ,

$54.Z50.0

h

A-~

MW

ii,._ i ._



Type of kctivi

tonr Oil~ft

Garatloans d tt~n $

on Oeat oflo4

I oanS to j., Nttti

Kion:r lioft r <
loano

I

,~ r~

ty
StUk o tree

!

%k-4



sta .te dteomi ttee

-'V

-~. 9.

Type of Activity

No details of candi-
date's loan to comittee.

Ito details of loan.

No details of contribu-
tions and loans .tKWidate
made to comittee.-'

Need further detaiS 'Of
candidate' s contri"iqoni
to comiu ttee.

No details of loan

Same as above

Same as above

No details of loans

Same as above

No details of loats

Same as above

Same as above

Same as above

Candidate's family'
may have received
proceeds of a bank
loan and committee
did not properly
report loan as debt.

No details of loans f
the-

$0400

SSI

$37A400-00

$79,191405

$35,800.00.

1SO

... ..

$3$soo0*r

.. U



Cadidate/Coml tteeState Type of Activity

No, detailsf104's frMG

Questions'-of 'Ove ,r"' $14
draft; , Iww4 f ';A
on th ow ~fwsused
for r nspamw1t 401tlonal
loans; la. *f n+r g on
other loant. '2

No detailS rI 1.P
transac -tiOS



TO: Charlie Steele

FROM4: BillYwo1
Los Scall

SUBJECT: Recommendation for Further Investi qa
on Loan ect Candidates and Cn

Attached is a list of nine House Candidates/Coa$t,from the 1976 loan survey project. The information , ,* on these individuals indicates that possible substan -violations have been committed. We think that MURs
be. opened on all of these nine and that they should. be" *Oto.:o the enforcement teams for preparation of reconmmen. 0B"TIn further action. The teams would decide whether the.'"'they uncover warrants a recommendation for reason to '.RFAI letter. The spread sheets attached for each dcommittee are meant as a starting point, and the tez.'assigned should research the file himself/herself.

We have updated this list with the status of the4 "candidate/committees at the disclosure level. Wherevssible, termination dates have been included, howviave been informed that dates for administrative to.i.e., by the staff here) are not recorded. Thiseked. I think we could proceed to investigate te*
ses-by acknowledging to. the res;p*ondents. or raciPiAU o* f iters that while we are aware of the termuif
-wnevertheless have discovered that certain informa' 4to be clarified.

While these matters are being reviewed we are a.and updating about eight other cases from the loan p*o- 41similar presentation.

Al 
,



2" .M *%I rT r 1

$30,000 loaned by '" to -cowdtte-os AprilCandidate , and A-hree others p3ar.."teed !*9,0 of oicozmittee repaid $1,975 in two ins e ts on October 7
November 29,1976. No other repaymnts lndicated 'by * a a
Status at'Diaelosurc level: Candidate reports te inedj

, Comaittee repo t(dAte unkown). •

20

*10,94.4 oane by u mbetwen September 7. 1976, and ovmbe , 976, h mkI

Maturing inl 90 days Ut. no repa&mets are iMnct.4 Ihe
loan of $201.81 in the July 10, 1 port, a as of te"Port, the 1976 loans are till beU omeds .
-cl0sUrs level:- Cilrd.&Jate reports vaived; Comittee reportif

$16,378.3 in iMkAio mUmber of loans to cALddt
19 ". and fty 23,1976 Listed asunitemised. Spread shet iloan(s) of $28,9.68 y h i, b e but reports f.- j*.tat Disclosure level: te e s terinated Januw' Zreports term ated (date unknown).

4. FredLv. & g= IL/Citjgen. roV Rohifn for Conr

Reubicn aryOf hushu loaned 4oite 4repayment. not tnlctd ata f$,*.~ shovi*

committee. See attachmnrt to i pra sheetvaoncezr1jpersonal loan of $50,000. Status at.Disclesure level Candi
administratively terminated; Committe, reports adain:steatel'

K

Zs

I -- IIIm x
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MMO4RA13DUM

TO:

FROM:

SUBJECT:

Charlie Steele

Bill Yowell
Les Scall

Recommendation for Further Invest gA
on Loan Hject Candidates and Comm.

Attached is a list of nine House Candidates/Cou naft",
from the 1976 loan survey project. The information lif sn
on these individuals indicates that possible substaft|
violations have been committed. We think that MURs W 44 ,
be opened on all of these nine and that they should b*I s;giq4
to the enforcement teams for preparation of recommenatlpnse
further action. The teams would decide whether the in oiat1
they uncover warrants a recommendation for reason to believe 'x
an RFAI letter. The spread sheets attached for each candidate/
committee are meant as a starting point, and the team mem bie.
assigned should research the file himself/herself. "

We have updated this list with the status of theae
candidate/committees at the disclosure level. Wherever
possible, termination dates have been included, howe4V ".'..vlw.
have been informed that dates for administrative ten 0
I (i.e., by the staff here) are not recorded. This shoI ld,
checked. I think we could proceed to investigate tOR*i:$
cases by acknowledging to the respondents or recipien t"- '0
the RFAI letters that while we are aware of the terai "
Ve nevertheless have discovered that certain inforati

be clarified. ,

While these matters are being reviewed we are al,-j't .

and updating about eight other cases from the loan p$ :
similar presentation.

-77



A.0

Cash contributions of $30,000 and $1,600 made b o aaa
committee. See attachment to spread sheet, conce
personal loan of $50,000. Stat .. .at Disciegr 1 l 4
administratively terminated; Committee reports admini.trati

+++,*

$'0000 loaned by. . to committee :on Ap~g1
CmAnidate -and three others guaateed $29,9300 ofr~t
omittee r~epaid $1,975 in txo istaflaents on October 7, i4

... other ro ::i "cat.... +

N"ovember 196. o t ed b sprea4
Status at Disclosre, levels Cadidate reV4ports terminated At
1977; Committee reports terminated (date unknoit). jm++-+ j

$10_5,924.74 loaned by ,~l w o
between September 7, 1976, and November 2, 1976. The ote-ftw
maturing in 90 days but no repayments are indicated. There sod
loan of $201.81 in the July 0, 1977 repot, and. as of the J}%* :

report, the 1976 loans are still being caried as debts. Bt t
closure levelt Candidate reports waived; Committee rePorti

$16, 378.03 in unknown number: of oans to cart8e jt-''
1976 and Play 25,1976 listed as unitemized. Spread sheet indiea*** *ther
loan(s) of $28,391.68 may have been made but reports are not 010 Status
at Disclosure level: Candidate reports terminated January 20, 1i'9; ... tee
reports terminated (date unknown),

4. Fred V. &WljMCitiens. for., for -Cogrss

Republican Party of Hawaii loaned, committee $50,000. Dat es'Lo*fIane
,. not indicated. Partia re t of V,0+6,60 shom

at Disc sure U 1 sCandidate o*ta qvrte±,: co........ pp



1.ons o cuuRtte of $12 000 and ~70~md

RepayUmflt of *4y $8,804034 "d wihrsiii ti:
StatusSt Ivipelo#Qre le.vel. Candidate reports af
termina~ted'; ooaittee reot af itrtivel to

To loans of $2,0 -and 'One-of $1,400 made or,
individulals. 4..tZ1lsure Jo, el Candidazv.,

terminated.

$40,000o in Loans fz
four indjividUals,%. SmIndivia I edorsed $3O 0*

WO*, andq tOof th~e $A gopefnt'
loan'-of $8,50 fro6A

Level C diat* e r*ts waived- quaterly

F our loans toCommittee from individuals in amoncits, -Of
e rmr.All other loans, to Comntte- from indiviua~sof-repayment. "~ tsa ~s~sr ll candi4*to ,

reports' terminateA: (dots'uknwn
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